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January 27, 2025 
 

To the Graduate Admissions Department at the Evergreen State College, 
 
 
It is with the greatest sincerity and utmost confidence that I recommend Kamal Simmons for 
admission to the Evergreen State College’s Masters in Teaching program. Already, Kamal is one 
of the most gifted educators I have ever worked with and I cannot recommend him enough for 
any field of education in which he wishes to pursue. 
 
I first came to work with Kamal in the fall of 2024 when he joined the staff of our small 
alternative high school program, the Olympia High School Freedom Farm, as a paraeducator. 
The students served by our program have predominately had negative experiences in the 
educational system; they’ve felt unconnected, left behind, and experienced a lack of 
responsibility and relevance when it comes to academic demands. In my eight years in education 
as a teacher and instructional coach – both in traditional and alternative program settings – I have 
never been so impressed by what can only be described as Kamal’s natural ability to connect and 
build positive relationships with students and support their understanding of difficult concepts 
across multiple content areas. Kamal is particularly gifted at noticing what individual students 
need in order to be successful and either initiating the delivery of that need or advocating for that 
student to the rest of the team. 
 
As an instructional partner, Kamal conducts himself with humility and courage, approaching 
anything he does not know with enthusiasm and eagerness, setting an example for us all. Kamal 
not only welcomes but seeks out responsibilities and can be trusted to follow through on any 
task; he is known to step in for anyone at the drop of a hat when there’s a need to pull small 
groups together and participate in our lessons in a manner that consistently elevates the lesson 
being taught. Kamal is reflective, self-aware, and approachable. As a colleague, Kamal has a 
very human-centered approach to our work, encouraging others to prioritize rest, fun, and joy in 
their lives while simultaneously making it known that he is willing to step up to support us in any 
way he can.  
 
Kamal is truly an asset to our team and will make an excellent addition to the Evergreen Master 
in Teaching program. Should any questions arise, I am happy to discuss Kamal’s qualifications 
further. 
 
 
In Community, 
 
 
 
Katie Savinski 
Freedom Farm Teacher 
ksavinski@osd.wednet.edu  
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