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June 25, 2023 
 
 
 
To Whom It May Concern: 
 
Ms. Zoe Ortega is applying to the Master of Environmental Science program at The Evergreen State College and 
has asked me to write on her behalf. I am extremely happy to do so. She is a motivated individual deeply 
committed to a exploring a career that combines the natural sciences and the environment; she is an excellent 
student and communicator with high standards and has a wonderful personality. In short, I believe she has all the 
earmarks to be a successful MES student. 
 
Zoe was enrolled in a 2022 spring quarter, upper-division science program I taught called Developmental 
Biology. The program covered cell biology, molecular biology, and developmental biology. This program was 
extremely rigorous. In fact, the material covered was equivalent to all the biology taught in the year-long 
Molecule to Organism program! From my initial contact with Zoe, I realized that she was an insightful, analytical, 
and interested student who consistently came to class well prepared. She did not hesitate to ask questions during 
lecture or to come to office hours or tutoring sessions to help clarify difficult material. Her exam scores were 
consistently in the top 10% of the class, demonstrating a thorough understanding of the concepts presented. 

 
Often you will find students who succeed in the classroom but are all thumbs when it comes to bench or field 
work. Zoe is unique in that she excelled in both areas. She has an innate desire to learn the background material, 
asks the right questions, and the drive to work out answers to those questions both on paper and at the bench. On 
numerous occasions she has expressed his desire to pursue graduate work.  
 
As I am sure the admissions committee knows, Evergreen is a unique institution emphasizing interdisciplinary 
teaching and learning, it encourages students to take responsibility for their own education. To that end, students 
are asked to learn from and teach each other as well as from the faculty. This environment fosters great 
intellectual growth. Zoe can take information, synthesize it and return with plausible connections and outcomes. 
She is also a strong group learner and is to be able to strike the appropriate balance in a group situation between 
serving as an active leader or an excellent listener.  
 
As I hope is clear from this letter, I hold Zoe in high regard. She is a dedicated student with great potential. I 
believe that she has some strong qualities (only a few of which are mentioned above) that will make her an 
excellent candidate for the MES program. If I can be of any further assistance, please do not hesitate to contact 
me. 
 
 
 
Sincerely, 

 
Nancy C. Murray, Ph.D. 
Member of the Faculty 
 


